G:\M\INGONZTX\GONZTX_002. XML

[~118114868]

(Original Signature of Member)

11910 CONGRESS
18T SESSION H o R.

To amend the Federal Credit Union Act to provide more loan flexibility
to credit unions, to amend the Federal Home Loan Bank Act to expand
homeownership access, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. VICENTE GONZALEZ of Texas introduced the following bill; which was
referred to the Committee on

A BILL

To amend the Federal Credit Union Act to provide more
loan flexibility to credit unions, to amend the Federal
Home Loan Bank Act to expand homeownership access,

and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Increasing Credit

(O R N )

Union Lending for Business Growth Act’”.

g:\VHLC\022825\022825.046.xml (96791113)
February 28, 2025 (3:16 p.m.)



G:\M\INGONZTX\GONZTX_002. XML

2
1 SEC. 2. EXPANDING CREDIT TO SMALL BUSINESSES.

2 Section 107A(¢)(1)(B)(i11) of the Federal Credit
3 Union Act (12 U.S.C. 1757a(c)(1)(B)(iii)) is amended by
4 striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000".

g:\VHLC\022825\022825.046.xml (96791113)
February 28, 2025 (3:16 p.m.)




....................................................


(Original Signature of Member)


		119th CONGRESS
1st Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend the Federal Credit Union Act to provide more loan flexibility to credit unions, to amend the Federal Home Loan Bank Act to expand homeownership access, and for other purposes.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. Vicente Gonzalez of Texas introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________




A BILL

To amend the Federal Credit Union Act to provide more loan flexibility to credit unions, to amend the Federal Home Loan Bank Act to expand homeownership access, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Increasing Credit Union Lending for Business Growth Act”. 


SEC. 2. Expanding credit to small businesses.

Section 107A(c)(1)(B)(iii) of the Federal Credit Union Act (12 U.S.C. 1757a(c)(1)(B)(iii)) is amended by striking “$50,000” and inserting “$100,000”.






  
    G:\M\19\GONZTX\GONZTX_002.XML XXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX 2/28/2025 15:15 XXXXXXXX 02/03/2025 11:35 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX 
  967911|3
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
   [~118H4868] 
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Mr. Vicente Gonzalez of Texas introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend the Federal Credit Union Act to provide more loan flexibility to credit unions, to amend the Federal Home Loan Bank Act to expand homeownership access, and for other purposes. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Increasing Credit Union Lending for Business Growth Act.  
  2. Expanding credit to small businesses Section 107A(c)(1)(B)(iii) of the Federal Credit Union Act (12 U.S.C. 1757a(c)(1)(B)(iii)) is amended by striking  $50,000 and inserting  $100,000. 
 


